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This column is dedicated to Denise Elinor Dodero whom we lost on July 29, 2008. We hope that her life can
give us inspiration to live each day to the fullest, enjoy our friends, and show our families how much we love
them. Denise's sister writes that she passed away just four days after her 50th birthday and that she was a
remarkable woman who loved her Cornell days, the career it brought to her, and the lifelong friendships she
maintained. She would have loved to be at her next class reunion, so Gale (her sister) asks you to remember
her and raise your glass in a toast to a wonderful classmate who loved Cornell as much as she loved life
itself.

Jeanne Welton Lawless, PhD '93, is back at Cornell. She is a research associate in Food Safety PSA
development for television broadcast. She enjoys reading, biking, hiking, and all the activities associated with
raising a family. She has been trying to re-establish herself in her field of nutritional/biological sciences back
in the US (which begs us to ask—where have you been?). Right now she would rather be traveling with her
kids, particularly in the US to show them their heritage. She fondly remembers the challenge of a
well-written prelim and the great feeling afterward of doing well on it, and would like to hear from Hetty
Richardson '79.

Barbara Greene (Chittenango, NY) is mom to two adopted Vietnamese children, Guy Thomas, 3, and Marly
Noelle, 20 months. She is a part-time psychologist working out of her home office and building a home in the
Bahamas. She recently returned from the Far East with her new baby and is happy to report that after two
surgeries, her little girl is free of her previous, significant facial deformity and that she is "a doll"! Barbara is
living her dream and remembers late night at the library at Cornell. She would love to hear from Jill Ghari
Vellinger.

Jay Cohen is a dermatologist in Needham and Newton, MA, both suburbs of Boston. His main passion these
days is photography and he has taken a number of nature photography workshops in the Adirondacks,
Virginia, West Virginia, and Maine. He enjoys shooting flowers, landscape, and wildlife, and has also been
doing abstracts. Check out his website at www.jaycohenphotography.com, which includes Cornell photos as
well. He hopes to shoot fall foliage in Ithaca this fall. Juliet Kolm Gibbs (Sudbury, MA) is director of human
resources at a software start-up that develops supercomputing software. She spends her extra time hanging
with her two little boys who somehow grew up while she wasn't looking! They are now 18 and 21. She also
volunteers at a local hospice and enjoys seeing lots of Cornell grads at the ECAC playoffs in Albany. What
would she be rather doing now? Chugging beer at the Chapter House; she remembers being with friends 24/7
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at Cornell!

Victoria Conn Halliday, BFA '80, is a landscape architect with her own business in Perkasie, PA, where she is
raising her wonderful twins, age 6. She spends time on the township "open space" committee re-writing the
open space plan, has been playing competitive polo, and is a rated player by the US Polo Association. The
only thing that she might rather be doing is a little more traveling. She remembers her friends in Ithaca and
learning all sorts of new things and would also like to hear from Jill Ghari Vellinger. Kathleen Coté Snyder is
owner/instructor of a Pilates studio specializing in rehab post-surgical breast cancer patients. She is involved
in yoga, running, and golf, and is president of the garden club. She ran a half-marathon, attended a CERE
conference, and lobbied to congressmen on issues of world hunger. Her memories of the years on the Hill
include the beauty of the campus, especially when spring would awaken all the plants and flowers, and the
students would emerge. Linda Goodman Shapiro (Ringwood, NJ) has returned to school and is active in
synagogue committees. She remembers the beauty of the campus and would like to hear from Gwen Korovin
and Rhonda Carniol.

Michael and Myra Shapiro Connolly's son Daniel has joined the Class of 2013 and will, they hope, take
Psych 101, where his parents met as TAs! Shirley Joy Hegel Hansen lives in Pennsylvania and is a
homeschool teacher. She enjoys folk dancing, karate, reading, and gardening and has been planting a
drought-resistant landscape in her front yard. She remembers hiking, exploring, eating ice cream, free
concerts, and the bell tower from her days on the Hill. Grace Sharples Cooke also lives in Pennsylvania,
where she is director of development family support services and serves on the board of directors at two
Quaker schools. She takes care of 37 acres of meadow, woodland, wetland, and floodplain on a conservation
easement that she owns. She hosted a day of activities for the Friends Environmental Education Network
Conference and discussed land management and environmental education. Even though she is busy, she
thinks that it would be fun to go back to school and get a master's degree. She remembers faculty and friends
and, of course, the library from the old days.

Ellen Faulkner Little (Oak Park, IL) is a senior technical portfolio manager of new products for World
Kitchen LLC working on various Corning brands. Nayla Rizk (San Mateo, CA) keeps busy as a partner at
Spencer Stuart's Silicon Valley office, a board member for the Harvard Business School Alumni Association,
and a trustee on the World Affairs Council. She found time in between to get to Australia over the winter.
Dennis Cahill (Fairfield, CT) keeps active in tenant affairs, including the Connecticut Public Housing
Resident Network. Eve Pranis (Richmond, VT) has her own consulting business, Education Innovations,
which she works on between biking, travel, gardening, and grandkids (by marriage). Marshall Dumont (West
Hempstead, NY) is with UBS Wealth Management as a recruiting officer. He still plays in various bands after
hours and wants to know where Kurt Davis is now.

Dawn Fotopulos (New York City) is assistant professor of business at Kings College and has had two
interviews on MSNBC. Leslie Gallo (Longmont, CO) lives near Boulder and works with IBM as an editor.
She spends her spare time remodeling her home and enjoying the locale with her family. Bonnie Koch
Hoggatt (Houston, TX) works with the American Bureau of Shipping as a global projects administration
manager. Bonnie would like to reconnect with Rita Long Cramer '79, MBA '82.

Wishing you all the best this holiday season from your correspondents: Cynthia Addonizio-Bianco, caa28 @
cornell.edu; Leona Barsky, leonabarsky @ aol.com; Dik Saalfeld, rfs25 @ cornell.edu; Tim O'Connor, tvo2
@ cornell.edu; and Dana Jerrard, dej24 @ cornell.edu.

81

While many of you are missing your children at college, I am dealing with a toddler in a Montessori school
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and a curious 15-month-old boy cruising around my house. Ella is thrilled with her new class of very curious
3- to 6-year-olds, and Brayden is concerned with his next climbing expedition. I am enjoying motherhood
very much. Quite different from the corporate world!

Regina Rousso Wilmes went to an informal mini-reunion at Flathead Lake in Lakeside, MT. Also present
were Ira Diamant '79, Rich DiNardo, Lynda Finn, Bill Freeman, MS '81, Emily Jones '80, Franny Osman,
Janet Pennisi, Lorisa Seibel, Chari Smith, Jim Tulsky, and David Weiss '82. Most became friends while living
in Risley from 1978-80; they have been gathering almost every other summer in various locations throughout
the US since 1994.

Jessica Pearlstein Zachs was treated (along with 80 friends) to a Bruce Springsteen concert (her first one was
at Cornell freshman year). She got to meet the Boss after the concert—pictures and autographs for all! Dale
and Mary Warner Webster have been in Charlotte, NC, for five years now and love it. Dale is the
environmental health and safety manager for BASF, and Mary is a clinical coordinator in labor and delivery
at a local hospital. Steven Pozzi recently moved to Seal Beach, CA, and is now president of Brenntag
Pacific. His daughter Natalie '09 graduated in May, son Blake is a sophomore at Northeastern, and Sarah, 11,
lives at home in Seal Beach. Ginger Sun is married to Arthur Ong '76. They have lived in Orange County for
the last five years. Oldest daughter Allison '12 is a sophomore at Cornell and is teaching rock climbing for
COE. Her second child, Amanda, still has a ways to go before she leaves for college.

Theresa Crisafulli Kratschmer and her husband, Ernst, whom she met at the Connection right after
graduation, are now enjoying an empty nest. They spend weekends traveling around looking for potential
retirement spots. While Ernst prefers warm weather and places like Florida, Theresa likes the cold and has a
tough time leaving the Northeast. Both like being near the water, though, so hopefully there's a compromise
in sight. In any case, they have a while to go. Both are still at IBM. Michael Strauss is still CFO for the
Bryant Park Hotel in New York, trying to survive the recession. Cathy Consentini Bonczek is consulting
(www.ccb-communications.com). She recently reconnected with Cindy Ahlgren Shea '79.

Lisa Wisznat Kirsten has been living in the San Francisco Bay Area for 20 years. She has two children and a
very entertaining Goldendoodle named Razzle. After a 15-year career in advertising, working in both New
York and San Francisco, she "retired" to the position of stay-at-home mom and very active
school/community volunteer, a career path that she loves. She also loves living near her former Cornell
roommate, Kitty Yates Edwinson '82, who lives only a mile away, and Lori Schifrin, who lives only ten
minutes away! Ellen Naismith Staley and husband Vic traveled the Northeast this summer in their Piper
Arrow. They stopped in Andover, CT, to see Jim '80 and Sylvia Reeves Dake. Another favorite stop was
Dayton, OH, where they visited Mark Dale. Nan Molofsky is working as SVP at the City Investment Fund, a
real estate investment fund cosponsored by Fisher Brothers and Morgan Stanley.

Suzanne Zeichner Sheres continues to work at Nemours Children's Clinic as a pediatric registered dietitian.
Patricia Lafrate Newman is a children's author, living in the Sacramento, CA, area. Her newest book is
Nugget on the Flight Deck. Karen Peltz Reinstein went on a spa trip to the Oaks at Ojai, CA, with Sheryl
Eisenstein Lewis and Ellen Hamburg Oster. Delightful! Tom Landauer runs his boutique management
consulting firm Landauer & Co. and is on the board of commissioners in Hatfield, PA. Debbie Jeon is the
legal director of the American Civil Liberties Union of Maryland, where she has been a staff lawyer since
1990. She moved out to rural Maryland, near the Pennsylvania line, a few years ago and is slowly renovating
an old farmhouse on a five-acre hillside.

Phil DiLernia owned the 12th largest power wheelchair company for 17 years (called Mr. Mobility), and
three years ago left that to become pastor of a church in Michigan! Cathy Ode Martersteck coordinates
family ministries for an Episcopal parish in Boulder, CO. Nancy Goldberg Whiteman is also in Boulder, and
they've had fun getting reacquainted. Anne Gozonsky Zaccardo plays keyboards in an all-female, classic
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rock cover band called the Mood Swings, a group of seven women/moms from the Millburn/Short Hills area.
John Hartman and his family have been on a mission to tour all 50 state capitals. They have now completed
48 of the 50. Only Boise and Honolulu remain. Wow!

Sheryl WuDunn and her husband, New York Times columnist Nicholas Kristof, were recently named the
recipients of the 2009 Dayton Literary Peace Prize for Lifetime Achievement. Congratulations! The prize
committee shared that the couple was chosen "in recognition of their work chronicling human rights in Asia,
Africa, and the developing world."

Betsy Cahn Niggli is now a preschool teacher working with 2- and 4-year-olds (right up my alley!). She
recently got together with Rhonda Eisner Batt. Patricia Weidman Fanders is back living in Ithaca and
currently deputy commissioner at the Tompkins County Board of Elections. Rhea Floersheimer Kaston is
director of employee relations for Barnes & Noble College Booksellers. Robin Rosenberg had a nice dinner
with her CAAAN committee, including classmate Dan Weisz. Robin definitely interviewed more high
schoolers this year than any other year, probably due to the increased interest in Cornell! Thanks, everyone!
Keep us informed! Betsy Silverfine, This e-mail address is being protected from spam bots, you need
JavaScript enabled to view it ; Kathy Philbin LaShoto, This e-mail address is being protected from spam
bots, you need JavaScript enabled to view it ; Jennifer Read Campbell, This e-mail address is being protected
from spam bots, you need JavaScript enabled to view it

82

We have been hearing from class members from all over the world. Deborah Sopher Matson and husband
Timothy '81, both MBA '87, live with their children in Hong Kong, where Deborah is the managing director
of Links Recruitment and has been busy "trying to keep my staff motivated and cash flow positive—and
looking at colleges with my oldest daughter." Connie Curilla has been working in Haiti for the past 23 years
and currently serves as a missionary for the Haitian American Friendship Counsel. She has been busy
reading, keeping in touch with family and friends, and making photo books documenting their work in Haiti.
Brian Gordon, an attorney practicing with Gordon and Ashworth PC in Merion Station, PA, notes that he has
had an opportunity to work with many Cornellians while serving as a local public official. He writes, "My
fun job is serving as a Lower Merion Township Commissioner. This is a 14-member township counsel. Of the
14, three are Cornellians. In addition to me, they are V. Scott Zelov '79, MBA '81, and Cheryl Block Gelber
'69, MA '71. We also have the pleasure of dealing with Michael Weilbacher '78, who is the director of the
Lower Merion Conservancy, and citizen activists Charles '52 and Alison Bliss Graham '52. Not surprisingly,
Scott (Republican), Cheryl (Democrat), and I (Democrat) work well together and frequently cross party lines
for the best ideas and solution."

Leon Singletary, who lives with wife Sandra (Clegg), MRP '82, in Blue Bell, PA, writes that he has been busy
building First Contact HR, a background screening and human resource consulting company. He noted, "The
company has doubled its annual revenues each year since inception and, as a result, is expanding its
operations headquartered in Fort Washington, PA." Leon has been an active supporter of local charities and
has biked 175-plus miles to raise more than $90,000 with his teammates for multiple sclerosis research. Marc
Jacoby and wife Mary live in Irvington, NY, where Marc enjoys "snow riding, live music, and clean living."
Marc is a musician and a member of Rock Mitzvah—"Not your mama's ordinary bar/bat mitzvah
band"—which can be found at www.rockmitzvah.com. Michael Greenberg, MBA '83, is the president and
CEO of Broom-field Education Group and Academic Achievement Group in Denver, CO, and has been busy
raising two daughters. Michael notes, "I may get the '82 alumni award for oldest dad of a toddler! Alexandra,
2, and Madeline, 5, keep us busy feeling young and old at the same time!" Michael Panosian (Beavercreek,
OH) has "retired from the Air Force and went back to full-time clinical practice as chief of otolaryngology at
the Dayton, OH, Veteran Affairs Medical Center."
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Mark Strickland lives with wife Kimberly in Columbia, MD, and works as a legal writing instructor at
Howard U. School of Law. Mark also writes that he has a leadership position in the Columbia Maryland
Stake of the Church of Jesus Christ of Latter-day Saints. Jacqueline Pollack Prescott (Livingston, NJ) writes,
"I am a full-time mother raising two teenage young adults." Daughter Marion graduated from high school in
June and attends the U. of Maryland. Son Daniel is a freshman in high school. She continues, "I am involved
in fundraising and charity work. I still keep up with the young kids on the tennis court—I am a former
member of Big Red women's tennis team." She also writes that she has been in touch with Risa Rahinsky
Weinstock—"and she is doing great!"

Mark and Roselle Dagostino Mesmer are busy raising their children Katie, 13, and Michael, 9. They
celebrated their 25th wedding anniversary in Paris. Mark is an enterprise software consultant and Roselle is a
cardiologist in Glen Mills, PA. Bruce Cohen (Woodbury, NY) serves as a managing director, head of HR for
Citibank's global banking and global transaction services businesses. He and wife Jodie visited Wally, MBA
'83, and Judy Chiang Hlawitschka at their home in Westport, CT. Bruce reports that his daughter Jamie '12
completed her freshman year in CALS and notes, "I can't believe it's been 31 years since we had our
freshman experiences!" Barbara Jeffery Danzi has been named the chief information security officer at
Garda Cash Logistics, the country's second largest cash logistics provider. Barbara had previously served as
a senior manager at Archer Technologies and has also held previous positions at DirecTV, United Health
Group, and Wachovia Dealer Services.

Please keep your news coming from around the world. I'm sure I speak for all of us when I say it's always
interesting to hear what is keeping our classmates busy. Doug Skalka, This e-mail address is being protected
from spam bots, you need JavaScript enabled to view it ; Steven Crump, This e-mail address is being
protected from spam bots, you need JavaScript enabled to view it ; Mark Fernau, This e-mail address is being
protected from spam bots, you need JavaScript enabled to view it

83

It's odd to be writing on a hot August day knowing that you will all read this during the November/December
holiday season, but here goes! I hope that many of you are joining our class for the Red Hot Hockey game at
Madison Square Garden on November 24. Family obligations keep me in Florida—maybe next year!

Carol McIntosh, MD '87, was honored by the Queen of England on June 11. She received the insignia of the
Most Excellent Order of the British Empire as a result of her work with HealthCap, a nonprofit organization
whose primary focus is improving the standard of health of the islands of Carriacou, Petite Martinique,
Grenada, and Canouan. The government of Grenada nominated her for her medical service to Grenada,
which remains part of the British Commonwealth. Francis and Crystal Collins Camargo '84 live in Lexington,
KY, where the architecture of nearby U. of Kentucky pales in comparison to the "gorges" beauty of our alma
mater. Francis stays very busy at CDP Engineers Inc. as a civil/stormwater group manager earning college
tuition for his daughters. He would much rather be playing golf, going to supper club, and socializing. He
would like to hear from Derek Marder and other Cornell friends at This e-mail address is being protected
from spam bots, you need JavaScript enabled to view it Congratulations to Robin Morley Bernstein, RN, on
her marriage to Jack in October 2006. Robin and Jack live in Philadelphia, PA.

Scott and Patty Palmer Dulman and their kids enjoyed a trip to Thailand to visit Patty's mother and family in
November 2008. Surong "Mike" Bulakul, ME '79, MBA '80, hosted a magnificent banquet for them at his
home in Bangkok. The Dulmans also visited Angkor Wat in Cambodia and the elephant country of Chiang
Mai. Additional drama was provided by anti-government protesters armed with plastic hand clappers and
golf clubs who blockaded the airport, extending their vacation by five days. They made it home to Arlington,
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VA, by way of Kuala Lumpur with a group of Thai Muslims leaving for the Hajj. Takoma Park, MD, is now
home to Beth Grupp, president of Beth Grupp Associates, which provides fundraising, strategic planning,
and organizational development consulting. Reach out to Beth at This e-mail address is being protected from
spam bots, you need JavaScript enabled to view it Tom Melendy (Getzville, NY; This e-mail address is being
protected from spam bots, you need JavaScript enabled to view it ) is a professor of microbiology at the U. of
Buffalo School of Medicine. He enjoyed an 18-month sabbatical/leave at the Henry Wellcome Inst. for
Comparative Medicine at the U. of Glasgow School of Veterinary Medicine.

Kathy Orr Pomerenk ( This e-mail address is being protected from spam bots, you need JavaScript enabled
to view it ) has been appointed membership manager at Hillwood Estate, Museum, and Gardens in
Washington, DC. Founded by American collector and heiress to the Post cereal empire, Marjorie
Merriweather Post, Hillwood Estate, Museum, and Gardens is one of the premier art collector's museums in
the US. The museum features the most comprehensive collection of Russian imperial art outside of Russia
and a world-renowned collection of 18th-century French decorative art and furnishings. The collection
includes Fabergé eggs, Russian porcelain, Russian Orthodox icons, Beauvais tapestries, and Sèvres porcelain.
Encircled by woodlands, the 25-acre estate provides visitors a tranquil oasis of luscious formal gardens.
Kathy has extensive experience as both a staff professional and a board member at several nonprofit
organizations. The mother of two children, now 10 and 14, Kathy earned a master's degree in art and culture
from Georgetown U.

Lastly, Mark Rhodes (Westfield, NJ; This e-mail address is being protected from spam bots, you need
JavaScript enabled to view it ) takes a break from his job as senior lawyer for mergers and acquisitions at
Citigroup to be a leader for a coed high school high-adventure venturing crew and a Class of '83 officer. He
and wife Kimberly (Osborn) celebrated 25 years of married life. Their daughter Amanda, 17, is a senior at
Kent Place School in Summit; son Christopher, 18, is headed to Michigan for aerospace engineering under
the Air Force ROTC scholarship program. After years in the finance industry, Kim is completing the
requirements to get a teacher's certification in family and consumer sciences.

On a personal note, I closed on a house in Venice, FL, in June, taking advantage of the $8,000 tax credit, as I
had not owned a home since 2004. My daughter Alex, 11, and I enjoy our pool and not having a landlord.
She started 6th grade at Island Village Montessori and participates in golf, theatre, French, and piano during
the after-school program. Business has been excellent in executive recruiting, and my firm, Domari &
Associates, moved into our own building in August. Happy Holidays to all! Send news to: Alyssa Bickler,
This e-mail address is being protected from spam bots, you need JavaScript enabled to view it ; and Lynn
Buffamante Schwarz, This e-mail address is being protected from spam bots, you need JavaScript enabled to
view it

84

I want to thank Lindsay Liotta Forness for all of her years sharing the writing of the 1984 Class Notes with
me. Lindsay is now our class president—congratulations! And thank you, Terri Port McClellan, for being our
class president for the past 25 years. I would also like to welcome Janet Insardi as my new co-class
correspondent. Please send your news to me or Janet. Our e-mail addresses are at the end of the column.

Jim Martin was named one of the top 50 doctors in his state by New Hampshire Magazine. Jim is an
emergency room doctor at St. Joseph's Hospital in Nashua, NH. When Jim isn't busy in the ER, he can be
seen on the ballfield coaching son Luke's Cal Ripken baseball team in Hollis, NH. Jim's wife, Deanne, and
daughter, Mary, are usually in the stands cheering the team on. Even though she's only going into first grade,
Mary already says she wants to go to the Cornell Vet college. Bill Nolan has joined the law firm of Barnes
and Thornburg as the first attorney in their Columbus, OH, office. Formerly of Squire, Sanders, and
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Dempsey LLP in Columbus, Bill joined Barnes and Thornburg as a partner in the firm's labor and
employment law department. Bill is a former two-term councilman and mayor of Powell, OH, as well as a
past member and chair of the board of trustees of the United Way of Delaware County. He is the author of
the Ohio chapters of four Bureau of National Affairs state-by-state treatises on trade secrets, covenants not
to compete, employee duty of loyalty, and tortious interference with contracts.

Terri Port McClellan spent a week in Cheyenne, WY, with son Harry. Terri's brother is a squadron
commander at F.E. Warren AFB out there. They went out to visit and attend Cheyenne Frontier Days, which
included going to their first rodeo. Terri writes, "I guess if you're going to go to your first rodeo, you might as
well go to the 'Big Daddy of 'em all!' Those bulls look so much bigger in person . . . and if anyone is
wondering, yes, I own red cowboy boots and a red cowboy hat."

Heidi Habicht Peterson is a family medicine—including obstetrics—physician. She still loves to kayak, hike,
and read and recently traveled to Bhutan for a trek. Her favorite memories of Cornell are adventures with
friends from Ecology House, including whale watching, ice cream runs, late night philosophical and political
discussions, and trips to the gorges to cool off on warm evenings. Heidi would like to hear from Anne Evens
'85. Janna Weil is the outreach coordinator for the Lancaster, PA, chapter of Buy Fresh Buy Local. She also
helps her friend run an herb shop. In her after-hours, Janna walks her dogs, provides foster care for dog
rescue groups, and is active in the local sustainable business network, SSBN. Janna writes, "I'm focused on
reclaiming my health and energy so I can enjoy a full life again, and am enjoying the peace and abundance of
my life and accepting the limitations." Janna would really like to hear from Ed Intemann, MFA '84. Thomas
Fric manages a Fleet Support Engineering Group for GE Wind Energy. Otherwise, he spends time with wife
Karen-Marie and their kids, coaching youth sports, playing tennis, and being an Audi enthusiast. He would
really like to hear from Michael Reid.

Dianne Clark Bermingham has been working for the same company for 18 years. Congratulations, Diane!
The company is now called Millard Group Inc. She works with multi-channel marketers. She has gone back
to horseback riding after a long absence, but is spending most of her time raising her two incredible
daughters. She writes, "I can't complain, but when the kids are grown I'll be ready to do something new.
Don't know what that will be." Pediatrician Cathy Hahn has spent 16 years at Pittsford Pediatric in Pittsford,
NY. She is mom to son Robbie, 7, and a pug named Earl, and is married to Robert Buhite '83. Recently,
Cathy's been training for a half-marathon. She would most like to hear from Mark Cogen, her "verts" lab
partner. Michael McGarrity is an endocrinologist in North Carolina. He and wife Sheila are busy enjoying
daughter Caitlin, 9. They enjoy camping and reading together. He would love to hear from Bonnie Granbow
Campbell, DVM '88, PhD '99.

Dr. Dennis Mitchell wrote with this amazing news: "I was diagnosed three years ago with a rare kidney
disease. On April 11, 2008, I received a kidney transplant from friend Leon Smart '82, BS HE '84, who saved
my life!" Karla Sievers McManus, This e-mail address is being protected from spam bots, you need
JavaScript enabled to view it ; Janet Insardi, This e-mail address is being protected from spam bots, you need
JavaScript enabled to view it Class website, http://classof 84.alumni.cornell.edu.

85

Happy Holidays to all of you! I know it is difficult to believe, but our 25th Reunion is just a little more than
six months away. Our reunion committee has been working hard to insure that it will be our best reunion
ever, so please mark your calendars for June 10-13, 2010. Thank you to everyone who has sent in your
news—we have a lot to share.

During the late summer, I (Leslie Nydick) enjoyed a great New York City evening with Liz Mozesky
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Langston and her three gorgeous daughters when they flew up from Navarre, FL, to visit with Sandy
Mozesky Kavanagh '86, her children, and her husband. Howard Spira, MBA '86, wrote from Japan, where
he, wife Hanan, and children have spent two and a half years. They are now enjoying time on the beach and
cycling while they determine the location of their next adventure, which may be back in the US or in another
country. Howard saw Richard Ortega in a play in Los Angeles. He remembers canoeing with Richard and
Bruce Schulman before freshman year.

Benjamin Rodefer is a member of the New Mexico House of Representatives and finds the time for jazz
guitar, collecting modern art as an art dealer, and starting a new solar company. He would much rather be
finding the time to visit his father in Paris, hiking in Santa Fe, playing with his kids, and watching an old
movie. His memories of the years in Ithaca include ten-mile runs in the snow, the "amazing" camaraderie of
the cross-country team, U-Hall 2, and the rented house at 410 Stewart. Joe LaVilla, the director of culinary
programs at the Art Inst. of Phoenix, wrote a book published by Wiley: The Wine, Beer, and Spirits
Handbook: A Guide to Styles and Service.

Cindy-Jo Gross (Brookline, MA) shared news of our classmates. She wrote that Audrey Sher and husband
Jay Irom welcomed their "beautiful" baby David on Aug. 23, 2008. Cindy-Jo also reported that Marcie
Mercatili Krauss and husband Steven '83 are thrilled that their daughter Julia '13 has begun her studies in
Arts and Sciences. Cindy-Jo, Melissa Josephson Edwards, Dorene Cadoff Rosenthal, and Myra Michael '84
hope to schedule a trip to Ithaca to visit with Julia.

Daniel Gehman, a principal with Thomas P. Cox: Architects Inc. in California, is "working hard to maintain a
company through trying economic times" while he is also "heavily involved in civic-oriented programs and
activities." He does wish he had more time for gardening, and remembers the camaraderie with fellow Class
of '85ers. All are invited to check out his blog (Gimme Shelter with Daniel Gehman) at
multihousingnews.com. Susann Berry (Omaha, NE), a proud mom and equestrienne, has been busy visiting
relatives in Florida and Germany, participating in horse shows, and supporting her son's blues band and her
daughter's musicals. When thinking about Cornell, she remembers a super education, the campus beauty,
freshman cheerleading, PMPs, Biochem, football, and friends. She would love to hear from Elizabeth Parle.
Claye Hart, a solutions architect for AT&T in Atlanta, enjoys watching his children play baseball, football,
and soccer, while he wishes for more free time for sailing. He would really like to hear from Ian Rowe (and
so would I!) and Robert Talley.

Denis Hurley is a personal injury trial lawyer in Albany, NY, and enjoys his time being a dad to Denis III,
who is looking at colleges, and Grace, a freshman in high school. He enjoys running 15Ks and is proud of the
marathon he ran a few years ago. He remembers those WGCs at the Hot Truck and going to the Hitchcock
Film Festival with Glen Antizzo at Cornell-in-Washington. Denis would love to hear from Glen, David
Berman, Doug Masters, and "the Zu Boys." Curt Hampstead works at the United Nations in creative
publications. When not at work, he spends time at the theater, dancing ballroom, and learning Chinese. He
enjoyed some free time hanging out with his kids in Florida. If he weren't doing all of that, he would rather
be producing, directing, and acting in movies (it's never too late, Curt!). What he remembers most about
Cornell is the camaraderie of the track team and the theater group. He would love to hear from Beverly.

T. J. Costello, BArch '85, is the principal and founder of Hierarchy Architects & Designers, which specializes
in mid- to high-end residential. T. J. volunteers as the president of the Manhasset Community Fund and
chairperson of the Chamber of Commerce Business Development. He has been even busier lately developing
a new startup Web company for homeowners seeking renovation advice. He remembers his many
all-nighters at Rand Hall and dragon coffee! David Eingorn and wife Lisa Ottenfeld are busy in Skokie, IL,
raising children Benjamin, 7, and Becky, 5. David is an assistant public defender for Cook County and is
busy "fighting for justice." Maybe he will share some of his memories of Cornell in person at reunion,
because on his news form, he wrote, "I refuse to answer on the grounds it might incriminate me." He hopes

Cornell Alumni Magazine - 1980 to 1989 ND09 http://webcache.googleusercontent.com/search?q=cache:lfUhAFWauroJ:c...

9 of 16 6/2/2012 10:51 PM



to see Erle Ellis, PhD '90, when he is in the Baltimore/D.C. area this fall.

Neal Foman and wife Sarah enjoy spending time with their children Matt, 13, and Lexi, 10, in Mendola
Heights, MN. Neal is an avid baseball fan who also is on two nonprofit boards, while professionally he is an
associate professor and the residency program director for dermatology at the U. of Minnesota. He would
love to be lounging on a beach in Hawaii ("with sunscreen," of course, since he is a dermatologist!) while he
remembers the late night PMPs at the Hot Truck. Alison May and Brian Florence, if you are reading this,
Neal would love to hear from you. Frank Capella, DVM '89, and wife Dee (Van Lee) '87 stay very busy with
sons Evan, 12, and Jonah, 10. Their activities include kayaking, geocaching, cooking, golfing, and scouting.
Frank has been a veterinarian for 20 years at the Village Veterinary Hospital, which he is proud to say has
been his only job since graduating from NYSCVM in 1989. Frank and Dee celebrated their 20th wedding
anniversary in July. They met at Cornell, and Frank points out that "nearly all the folks near and dear to me
are Cornellians." He would like to hear from Bert Lindsey, Bryan Bayerdorffer, and Jim Bischoff.

Again, thank you to everyone who has been sending in your news. We have a lot more to share, so you can
look forward to lots of news in the next few columns leading up to our 25th Reunion. Mark those calendars
now because we want to see all of you in Ithaca in June! Have a very happy and healthy New Year! Please
continue to send us your news! Leslie Nydick, LNydick @ aol.com; Joyce Zelkowitz Cornett, cornett0667
@ comcast.net.

86

Babies are still part of our news. I take this as a sign that we aren't over the hill. We're climbing Libe Slope—
ascending! Mark Katz and his wife, Jenny, welcomed their first baby, Elias Benjamin, into the world on
09/09/09. Congratulations to Mark from your numerically impressed classmates! Stacey Davidson Blecher
gave birth to son Jacob Arden in 2008. He joined big brother Hayden, 7, and big sister Sydney, 4. Stacey and
her husband live in Cream Ridge, NJ. She's back at work at JPMorgan Chase in Manhattan, where she's been
in-house employment counsel for over 16 years. She says that she's worked for several predecessor banks,
due to various mergers and acquisitions, but has kept the same desk throughout! She remains active in
CAAAN, co-chairing committee 25 (Stuyvesant High School) with Jennifer Chung '98. And if Edith Shapiro
Sitrin '85 is out there, Stacey would love to hear from you.

Bob Clendenin lives in Burbank, CA, with sons Willem, 7, and Aidan, 4. Bob is an actor who can be seen in
both Star Trek and Race to Witch Mountain. He also appeared in an episode of "The Closer" that aired
August 24. My daughter and I plan to see Race to Witch Mountain; Bob reported that he plays Lloyd, the
taller, weirder looking crony of Gary Marshall, a UFO expert. Tomas Magana is a pediatrician at Children's
Hospital in Oakland, CA. He works to encourage high school students from disadvantaged areas to consider
health careers through his organization FACES for the Future. The California Wellness Foundation honored
Tomas as a "Champion of Health Professions Diversity." Congratulations, Tomas!

Back on the East Coast, Mindy Kaplan Silberg is a sales rep for a book and gift line. She gets to travel to
Long Island and gets first crack at all the new books. She also enjoys time with her children Michael, 12, and
Tara, 10. The family traveled to Washington, DC, and Florida. Susan Hirsch Levy-Cantor used a free airline
ticket to travel from New Jersey to the Pacific Northwest, where she visited Amy Blumenberg '87 and
Christine Nitzsche Go '84, MBA '91. Fred Hedengren is a high school math teacher as well as a lacrosse and
hockey coach for his high school. This busy schedule, plus his children's sports schedules, doesn't leave much
time for hanging around, but Fred sounds quite happy with his family's many activities. He's married to
Marissa (Rago) '87.

We rarely report on the goings on at UMass, but one of our own, Paul Hickey, is going to be developing
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UMass Boston's master plan. Paul is LEED accredited, which means "Leadership in Energy and
Environmental Design," so we're looking for very green development in the Boston area. Also putting his
work skills to good use is Steven Getman, an attorney who is helping the Seneca County SPCA fight recent
zoning changes that threaten to shut down the dog rescue and shelter. We love to hear these great pro bono
stories, so keep them coming! Susan Seligsohn Howell, my co-columnist, generously gave me a news update
for this column. She ran into Amy Brown Fraser '84 last spring at the New England Interschols, a crew race
for New England high schools. Amy's son and Susan's daughter were each rowing for their schools. It had
been 24 years since they had seen each other, but they easily recognized one another. Susan also got to visit
with Harry and Sydney Solomon Neuhaus in Brooklyn. They enjoyed adult time while all of their kids were
away at camp. She reports, "A highlight for me was walking across the Brooklyn Bridge, which I hadn't done
since I was a kid growing up on Long Island." Professionally, Susan is still marketing director at their Boston
area residential construction company. After 12 years, they're "renovating" their corporate identity with a
new logo and modified name. The new website launches in September. Check it out at
www.howellcustombuild.com.

We enjoyed our annual visit with the Howell family in June on Shelter Island. Cornellians present included
Sue Joyner Hine '61, Clarkson '85 and Laura Nieboer Hine, and Susan and husband Steve '84. Hard to
believe, but the topic at hand was beginning the college search for our oldest children. I am now the food
editor for Better, a magazine focused on the Chicago area, and a features and food writer for
MakeItBetter.net. It's a lot of fun—cooking, writing, talking about food with chefs—some of my favorite
things all wrapped into a job.

We always need more news. Send it to us via Facebook (Cornell University Class of 1986) or e-mail to:
Laura Nieboer Hine, lauracornell86@sbcglobal; and Susan Seligsohn Howell, This e-mail address is being
protected from spam bots, you need JavaScript enabled to view it

87

A few months ago, we had an update from a classmate in Alaska. This time a report from our 50th state,
Hawaii, finds its way to our column. Your classmates would love to hear from you, whether home is in
Ithaca, NY, or on the other side of the globe.

Douglas Kurth, BArch '88 (Mililani, HI) is an architect with Naval Facilities Engineering Command in Pearl
Harbor. He reports, "I recently returned to my civilian job after a nine-month active-duty mobilization with
the Navy Reserve, including a six-month tour of duty in Iraq as the facilities director for the First Marine
Expeditionary Force in Al Anbar Province." He is very happy to be home now with his wife and twin
daughters.

Thomas Riford would enjoy being in Hawaii right now, specifically Maui, visiting his father, Steve Riford '52,
a former NYS senator. Thomas is president and CEO of the Hagerstown-Washington County Convention and
Visitors Bureau in Maryland. He is also a part-time newscaster at a local radio station and gets a little busier
in the winter when he coaches and teaches skiing at Whitetail Ski Resort. Thomas enjoys skiing, flying, and
volunteering and gives up any free time remaining to his children, ages 17, 15, and 13. A veteran of the US
Marine Corps, he stays involved by helping with an annual fundraising concert for veterans. Recent efforts
supported purchase of a van used to transport patients to the local Veterans Administration hospital. Fond
memories of Cornell for Thomas include playing football, skiing at Greek Peak (where he worked for ten
seasons), and working at local radio stations WTKO and WQNY.

Steven Sinofsky has been named president of Microsoft's Windows division, "where he will have
accountability for the overall Windows business, from development to business strategy and marketing for
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Windows, Windows Live, and Internet Explorer." Jennifer Morrill (Washington, DC) directs media relations
with the American Farmland Trust. She is involved with farm bill reform and ecosystem services for
agriculture. Jennifer has fond memories from Cornell of "variety in everything—people, classes, activities!"

Allison Fennell, DVM '91, is a veterinarian and co-owner of Colonial Animal Hospital in Springfield, VA. She
has a son and now enjoys "exploring all new things being a mom." When not busy with work or family,
Allison enjoys anything outdoors, especially hiking, cycling, rollerblading, and tennis. Her fondest memories
from Cornell are the "endless hiking trails, the outdoors, the Farmers' Market, and the Commons." Lisa
Gangarosa is a gastroenterologist at the U. of North Carolina, Chapel Hill. Her extracurricular hours are
spent watching her daughter Rachel, 15, play softball and basketball, and her daughter Cristina, 10, play
soccer. Lisa has great Cornell memories of "hanging out with friends from Alpha Phi and Zeta Psi and my
non-Greek apartment-mates Karen Lootens Odden and Diana Kim." She would love to hear from Howard
Goldberg, Christa Siering '85, Melissa Pepling '85, and Carol Slaughter Holland '89.

Susanna Gordon provided an update for herself and spouse Eli Rotenberg. Susanna is deputy program
director for Catastrophic Event Mitigation at the Sandia National Laboratories in Livermore, CA. Eli is a
senior staff scientist at Lawrence Berkeley National Lab in Berkeley, CA. Susanna has good memories of
Cornell, namely "good friends, good food, good ice cream, and good times in Risley!" Thomas Hurbanek, BS
'89, reports that his day job finds him working in critical infrastructure response as a senior investigator with
the NYS Police Computer Crime Unit. On a personal note, Thomas "finally got married to a very special
woman," Nichole. Tom Bowman '89 and Eric '88 and Liz Wayner Boham '90 attended the wedding held in
Lake Placid, NY. Reaching back to his Cornell memories, Thomas recalls the great end-of-year party on Libe
Slope. He would love to hear from Tom Aug, "barefoot kicker and chicken man . . . Where are you, Augie
Dawg?"

After 12 years in Houston, TX, where he was a partner with Booz Allen in Houston, Tim Donohue has
relocated to the Northeast. Residing in Darien, CT, Tim is a managing director for Columbia U.'s endowment
at Columbia Investment Management Co. He reports that "it is an interesting time to become an investor!"
Cornell's Adult University (CAU) let us know that Susan Stachnik Egan visited the Gardens of Tuscany last
year as a participant in their 2008 off-campus study tours, seminars, and cruises.

If you have anything you would like to share with your classmates, send your news, comments, or Cornell
memories to either Heidi or me, or post an update at the Cornell Class of '87 Facebook page. Brenna Frazer
McGowan, This e-mail address is being protected from spam bots, you need JavaScript enabled to view it ;
Heidi Heasley Ford, This e-mail address is being protected from spam bots, you need JavaScript enabled to
view it

88

Greetings, Class of '88. Here are the most recent updates from your classmates. Jeff MacCorkle is still in
China and is a partner with Booz & Co. in Beijing. He looks forward to spending time with wife CJ and
daughter Christina in California. He recently spent some time with Todd Glass and Dan Goldman '87 on the
Russian River in California. Jouel Velasquez moved to Huntersville, NC, in August 2007. He has
tremendously enjoyed the great friends at the church he attends with wife Karen, who is glad to be back to
her Southern roots. He writes: "We love it down here in the South, compared to our 40-plus years in the
North, and while we miss some good restaurants (NYC), we love the Southern living. Just finished an
outdoor kitchen/living space and it's nice to be outside with so much space. Our daughter Jodi is 5 now, and
we are in the process of a second adoption; we go to China in four to six months."

David Levine, MD '92, still works as an attending orthopedic surgeon at the Hospital for Special Surgery in

Cornell Alumni Magazine - 1980 to 1989 ND09 http://webcache.googleusercontent.com/search?q=cache:lfUhAFWauroJ:c...

12 of 16 6/2/2012 10:51 PM



New York City. His wife, Davena (Barfus), completed her master's in early childhood education from Bank
Street College. The couple lives with daughter Sophia, 16, and son Payton, 13, in Bedford, NY. Marybeth
Comins Woods (Westport, CT) went on a trip to the Cape Cod National Seashore with family and friends.
She's done a lot of deep-sea fishing with her twin boys. She runs her own business, Woods Design, from
home and works on high-end spec and custom homes in the Westport area. She writes, "Alice King '87 came
up for the weekend to go biking/kayaking with me. Eric Lehto, BArch '88, works nearby in New Haven,
overseeing a huge housing development in that city, and sometimes appears for cocktails! I also had a chance
to talk to my former roommate Mary Wang, BArch '90, who works as an architect out in San Francisco and
lives with her daughter, 9, in a house overlooking the bay."

Cheryl Yancey-Biron ( This e-mail address is being protected from spam bots, you need JavaScript enabled
to view it ), my ILR classmate, is working on business development at her company, One Horn
Transportation. Based in northern New Jersey, they ship truckloads and LTL on flatbed and dry van tractor-
trailers locally, regionally, nationally, and into Canada. She met husband Louis during their MBA programs,
and they worked in corporate America for quite a while. "In 2005 we went out on our own, and it's been
great! On a personal note, we live in Wayne, NJ. Our children Alexander, 12, and Genevieve, 9, are enjoying
their summer. During the school year, they are very active with sports, music, and dance (Genevieve). We
love to ski as a family and spend many weekends at Killington, VT. If any old friends are in or close to
Wayne or ski a lot at Killington, I'd love to get together with them."

Francis Wade's ORIE skills have been put to innovative use lately. He has come up with a new approach to
professional time management. More info is at 2time-sys.com. "I am also working on a book on the topic,
entitled 'Perfect Time Management,' " he writes. "This was all inspired by my return to live in Jamaica four
years ago, after arriving in the US in 1984 to attend Cornell." Last year Alan Paez was appointed as a US
Administrative Law Judge with the Social Security Administration and left Washington, DC, to work in
Milwaukee, WI. His Honor reports, "I returned to Washington, DC, in July 2009 to be a judge with the
Federal Mine Safety & Health Review Commission. My office is across the street from Georgetown Law,
where I graduated in 1991. Although it's a short stroll from the law school to my new offices, it was a long
and interesting journey to get the judgeship. My work as a litigator for the US Dept. of Labor, my focus on
worker safety issues, and my ILR degree from Cornell prepared me well. I'm happily married to wife Laura
and we reside in Alexandria, VA, with our children Sarah, 13, Anna, 11, and Evan, 8."

After being a full-time mother for 11 years, Ellen Phillips Warsaw has gone back to work part-time managing
a small physical therapy clinic. On August 6, she celebrated her 20th wedding anniversary with Craig '86.
Congrats to you both! Their oldest child is now a high school senior applying to colleges. "That seems
impossible," Ellen writes, "since it seems WE were just on the Hill ourselves! Her college quest has brought
out lots of memories and focused our attention on how meaningful our Cornell experiences were." Many in
our class, myself included, still have younger kids. When Alicia Schwarcz e-mailed her update, her little girl
had just turned 4 months old. Nicole Amelie was born April 7. Alicia writes, "Nicole's twin brothers Liam
and Timmy, 3-1/2, are having a great time with their new baby sister. After Nicole was born, Dawn Seibert
came to visit with her 2-year-old daughter Loretta."

And last but certainly not least, Alan Riffkin mentioned that he's been busy catching up with Cornell friends.
"I had a great dinner over the summer in Brooklyn with Aaron Pollock and his wife when they were in NYC
visiting from their home in San Francisco. Mark Wood and his wife, with their newborn baby, and Mike
Weissman and his wife were all in attendance. I will be catching up with Matt Bromberg and his family while
we are in Westport for the month of August." I had the pleasure of catching up with David Spencer '87 when
he was in New York City during a quick trip back to the US. For years David has been in Asia; he runs a
fund of funds called Emerald Hill Capital, based in Hong Kong, that covers Asian investment. It's always
great to kick back over a few drinks with old friends. So let's raise a glass, Class of '88, and drink a toast to
honor long-lasting friendships. Brad Mehl, This e-mail address is being protected from spam bots, you need
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JavaScript enabled to view it ; Sharon Nunan Stemme, This e-mail address is being protected from spam
bots, you need JavaScript enabled to view it ; and Steven Tomaselli, This e-mail address is being protected
from spam bots, you need JavaScript enabled to view it
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Greetings, everyone! I (Lauren Flato) am writing my first column just a couple of months after our 20th
Reunion, which was truly inspiring. The weather was great and the organizers did an amazing job. Kudos,
again, to Debbie Schaffel, Carol Borack Copenhaver, and Erika Ange. Can't wait to see what they have in
store for us for the 25th. We brought our children from California to New York City and Ithaca for the first
time and they loved it. The weather even cooperated when we went to the Statue of Liberty. In the City, we
enjoyed some wonderful East Coast pizza with Chris Saxman '88, along with Stephen Sinaiko, wife Jessica,
and their children Nathan, 4, and Rachel, 2. Steve is a partner at Kramer Levin in Manhattan, where his
practice focuses on complex commercial litigation. The next day we were all off to Ithaca!

Also coming in for Reunion from the West Coast was Will Riffle, founder, president, and CEO of Adhost
Internet in Seattle. He didn't bring the family this year, but is considering bringing them to reunion next year
with wife Amy (Ringkob) '90. Jake Schaible arrived from San Diego with his new bride Suzanne; they were
married Feb. 14. Jake is president of Toscana Ventures, a biopharma business development/new venture
consultancy. Traveling even farther to reach the Hill, Carlyse Marshall Evans came in from Prague, and
husband Bob made it from Armenia! A special welcome back to Carlyse—after more than a decade of living
abroad she is finally, as of this writing, living back in the US. Her new position as director of global emerging
markets for the law firm Baker and McKenzie is based in Chicago. She is looking forward to exploring the
city and would rather be doing anything but packing and unpacking.

Also deserving a big welcome home is Ben Richardson, who deployed to Afghanistan for a year with the
New York National Guard and returned safely in January. It was exciting to introduce his kids Claire, 11, and
Dane, 8, to my kids Gabrielle, 8, and Jacob, 6, as Ben had introduced me to my husband, Steven Labovitz
'92, during senior year. Ben and wife Nancy both teach history at Oswego High School. In the what-a-
coincidence department, it was discovered that Gerry Chu, an SAE fraternity brother of Ben's, had attended
that high school when growing up in Oswego. Gerry is a pathologist at the Dana-Farber/Harvard Cancer
Center and enjoyed a lengthy trip to China with relatives. Also coming in from Upstate New York were Rick
and Lisa Hilbert Watt, who met freshman year in Dickson Hall and have been together ever since. Rob and
Karen DiUlio Ceske '92 also brought their kids Marie, 10, and John, 8, from Scarsdale to Ithaca for the first
time. They had a great time with our kids discovering the A.D. White Library. Rob is chief risk manager,
treasury and global funding operations for GE Capital in Manhattan.

Sadly, all of the above-mentioned people came to Ithaca not only for Reunion, but to attend a memorial
dinner for Lance Peters, MD '94, who passed away in December 2008. Also attending the dinner from the
SAE class of 1988 were Mike Giuli '88, Mark Ahrens '88, Ray Hsiao, Jeff Long '88, and Kevin Merriman '88.
Diane Miller '88, Brian Elliott '91, and Geoff Ryan '90 also joined the group, as did Elinor Langfelder
Schwind '90 and Alysia Sinrod Reid '90, next year's 20th Reunion chairs.

The first person I ran into after arriving at Reunion was Tony Ross, who is director of worldwide planning for
Apple, right around the corner from me in California. Christian Barry runs education and training for GE's
healthcare systems business. He is enjoying parenting his first child, Vivian, born this February, and would
love to hear from Jim Tangorra, MS '90. I can help him with that, as I chatted with Jim at Reunion. He is an
assistant professor of mechanical engineering at Drexel U. in Philadelphia. As we caught up, we discovered
that our sons had independently found each other and were playing together on the lawn outside the class
tent.
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Also seen at Reunion were John Dunn, a pediatrician at Seattle Children's Hospital, and Suki Tepperburg, in
family practice at Boston U. Medical Center. Judy Nguyen, an anesthesiologist for a private practice group,
sent an update from Northern Virginia. She is active with Operation Smile, a group of doctors that travels the
world to repair children's cleft lips and palates; she has completed eight missions since 2005! Dina Weiss-
Linfoot is an assistant professor of ob/gyn at Mercer U. School of Medicine in Savannah, GA. Dina and
husband Scott welcomed their third child, Sydney, in September of last year.

Michelle Fried Berti is taking time off from J.P. Morgan to enjoy life in Hong Kong with her family. She is a
member of a competitive dragon boat racing team and would love to hear from all the Zoo Hall 5'ers. Also
offshore is Chris Osgood, COO of the Pacific Radio Group of 14 radio stations in Hawaii. His weekly
commute is from Maui to the Big Island via turboprop. Can't argue with that! Also spending lots of time in
the air is Thomas Van Tiem Jr., a captain for Jet Blue Airways out of JFK. He is busy raising a son, 17
months, and a daughter, 2 months, at home in South Carolina. Daniel Coultoff is a partner at Latham,
Shuker, Eden and Beaudine LLP. He is also president of the board of directors of the JCC of Greater
Orlando and manages to run half-marathons as well. Kevin Cook is a pepper breeder in Naples, FL; he
received the Presidents Award from Rogers Seed Co. for significant contributions to the vegetable industry
for his introduction of new squash and pepper varieties. He purchased a home on the coast of Maine in 2007.

Speaking of New England, Shannon Buckley Gleason (Middlebury, VT) is still an environmental consultant
and otherwise a hockey, soccer, swimming, and lax mom. In Boston, Jennifer Thomas Harkins works as VP
of consumer deposits at Sovereign Bank. She and Brian '88 have been busy remodeling their little ranch into
a nice colonial for Rachel, 12, Emily, 9, and Kennedy the black Lab. Joyce Dupnack Wigsten stayed close to
Ithaca. She received her master's in teaching from SUNY Cortland in May and keeps busy supporting arts
and academics in the Lansing area. Also nearby is Katherine Jackson Saufley, a "housefrau and mamma" in
Syracuse. She is busy parenting four kids ranging from 9 to 1, and working part-time for the US Census as a
crew leader for Syracuse.

Please keep sending that news via e-mail or snail mail. Check out the Class of '89 Facebook page and get
involved! Fill up our mailbox! Lauren Flato Labovitz, This e-mail address is being protected from spam bots,
you need JavaScript enabled to view it ; Kimberly Levine Graham, This e-mail address is being protected
from spam bots, you need JavaScript enabled to view it ; Stephanie Bloom Avidon, This e-mail address is
being protected from spam bots, you need JavaScript enabled to view it ; Anne Czaplinski Treadwell Bliss,
This e-mail address is being protected from spam bots, you need JavaScript enabled to view it
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