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Supreme Court Holds that the FSIA Does Not Limit 
Post-Judgment Discovery 
By Barbara R. Mendelson, J. Alexander Lawrence and Daniel Matza-Brown 

In its latest decision interpreting the Foreign Sovereign Immunities Act (FSIA), the Supreme Court made clear that 
any claim of immunity by a foreign state must rise or fall based on the text of the FSIA.  Because the FSIA does 
not spell out any immunity or special protections for foreign states that have already lost civil suits and are the 
target of post-judgment discovery, foreign states cannot rely on the FSIA to resist such discovery.   

FACTS OF ARGENTINA V. NML 

In 2001, in the midst of a severe economic downturn, Argentina defaulted on its debt obligations.  NML Capital, 
Ltd., a bondholder, sued Argentina for its unpaid debts in federal district court in New York.  The FSIA did not 
shield Argentina from suit in federal court because the bond indenture agreement between Argentina and NML 
contained a broad waiver of Argentina’s immunities.  NML prevailed in each of its 11 actions against Argentina, 
yielding judgments of $2.5 billion.  

After Argentina failed to pay, NML sought to execute its judgments against Argentina’s property, initiating 
attachment proceedings in federal district court.  For more than a decade, NML pursued discovery regarding 
Argentina’s property and assets, including through third-party discovery of banks where Argentina maintained 
accounts.  In particular, NML subpoenaed two banks with operations in New York City, requesting information 
about Argentina’s balances and transaction history.   

Argentina and the banks sought to quash the subpoenas, claiming that they sought information about property 
that was immune from attachment under the FSIA.  The district court denied the motions to quash, and the United 
States Court of Appeals for the Second Circuit affirmed that decision.   

PROPERTY PROTECTED BY THE FSIA 

The FSIA significantly limits the types of property that may be attached or executed in satisfaction of a judgment 
obtained in the United States against a foreign state.  Critically, a foreign state’s property is immune from 
attachment or execution unless it is “property in the United States” and meets other enumerated requirements.   

THE “SINGLE, NARROW QUESTION” BEFORE THE SUPREME COURT 

Argentina petitioned the Supreme Court to decide whether post-judgment discovery is limited to those assets that 
are potentially subject to execution under the FSIA or, rather, whether such discovery may be ordered with 
respect to all assets of the foreign state regardless of their location or use.   

Argentina’s petition, according to the Court, raised a “single, narrow” question:  Do the usual rules of post-
judgment discovery apply to discovery targeting the property of a foreign state or does the FSIA specify a different 
rule?  
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FSIA DOES NOT ALTER THE RULES OF POST-JUDGMENT DISCOVERY 

The Court held that the FSIA does not limit or alter post-judgment discovery and, as a result, the federal discovery 
rules applied to NML’s discovery requests.   

The Court’s holding was based on its long-standing deference to the political branches in determining when to 
exercise judicial power over foreign states.  The Court explained that the FSIA is intended to be a “comprehensive 
set of legal standards governing claims of immunity in every civil action against a foreign state.”  As a result, the 
Court refused to glean from the FSIA any additional immunities or protections that are not clearly set forth in the 
text of the statute itself.  Because the FSIA does not forbid or limit post-judgment discovery, and contains no 
“plain statement” deviating from the federal discovery rules, the Court refused to find that the FSIA limits post-
judgment discovery in any way.   

OTHER POTENTIAL LIMITS TO POST-JUDGMENT DISCOVERY 

Looking beyond the FSIA, however, the Court acknowledged the possibility of other limitations on post-judgment 
discovery against foreign states, including, for example, arguments based on privilege, burden and comity.  The 
Court found that none of those other potential limits on discovery, however, were properly presented or preserved 
by Argentina in its appeal.  While the Court offered little guidance as to the merits of such arguments, the Court’s 
decision reinforced that litigants should look to all applicable federal and state law principles when litigating their 
discovery disputes, and should be sure to preserve those issues for appeal as well. 
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About Morrison & Foerster: 

We are Morrison & Foerster—a global firm of exceptional credentials. Our clients include some of the largest 
financial institutions, investment banks, Fortune 100, technology and life science companies.  We’ve been 
included on The American Lawyer’s A-List for 10 straight years, and Fortune named us one of the “100 Best 
Companies to Work For.”  Our lawyers are committed to achieving innovative and business-minded results for our 
clients, while preserving the differences that make us stronger.  This is MoFo.  Visit us at www.mofo.com. 

Because of the generality of this update, the information provided herein may not be applicable in all situations 
and should not be acted upon without specific legal advice based on particular situations.  Prior results do not 
guarantee a similar outcome. 

 
2 © 2014 Morrison & Foerster LLP | mofo.com           Attorney Advertising 

 

http://www.mofo.com/people/m/mendelson-barbara-r
mailto:bmendelson@mofo.com
http://www.mofo.com/people/l/lawrence-j-alexander
mailto:alawrence@mofo.com
http://www.mofo.com/

